

BID TABULATION FORM

NAME OF PROJECT
New Well #7 & Well House Renovation
Village of Raymond
Raymond, Montgomery County, Illinois

Hurst-Rosche, Inc.
 Hillsboro, Illinois: 217-532-3959

Project Number: HR 170-0868
 Client: Village of Raymond

BID OPENING:
Date: Friday, May 22, 2020
Location: Raymond Village Hall
Time: 2:00 p.m.

| Bidders Name & Address | Estimate of Probable Cost | Haier Plumbing & Heating 301 Elkton Street Okawville, IL 62271 | Municipal Well & Pump 1212 Storbeck Drive Waupun, WI 53963 | Cahoy Pump Service 24568 150th Street Sumner, IA 50674 | Davinroy Mechanical 44 Empire Drive Belleville, IL 62220 | Grosch Irrigation 13590 N. St. 29 Mason City, IL 62664 | Brotcke Well & Pump PO Box 1168 Fenton, MO 63026 | Layne Christensen 2399 Cassens Drive Fenton, MO 63026 | Korte & Luitjohan 12052 Highland Road Highland, IL 62249 |
|---|---------------------------|--|--|--|--|--|--|---|--|
| Bid Pkg A (Well) | \$62,000.00 | NO BID | \$94,463.00 | \$82,097.00 | NO BID | \$33,824.00 | \$75,865.00 | \$67,902.50 | NO BID |
| Bid Pkg B (Well House) | \$150,000.00 | \$265,000.00 | NO BID | NO BID | \$307,100.00 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$247,880.00 |
| Bid Pkg C (Combination) | \$212,000.00 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| Bid Security B=(BID BOND) @ 5% C=(Check) @ \$ | | B - 5% | B - 5% | B - 5% | B - 5% | B - 5% | B - 5% | B - 5% | B - 5% |
| Alt. Bid #1 (Permanent Well Pump) | \$15,000.00 | NO BID | \$30,510.00 | \$21,228.00 | NO BID | \$32,215.00 | \$40,158.00 | \$31,103.75 | NO BID |
| Totals = | | \$265,000.00 | \$124,973.00 | \$103,325.00 | \$307,100.00 | \$66,039.00 | \$116,023.00 | \$99,006.25 | \$247,880.00 |
| ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDA NOS. 1, 2 & 3 (Y/N) | | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES |
| REMARKS | | | | | | | | | |

Number of Addenda
3

Bid Opening Attended By: Scott L. Hunt, PE

Date: May 22, 2020